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Aelliana Caylon has endured much, and finally, she appears to have won all: a spaceship, comrades,
friends—and the love of a pilot she adores.

Even better that her lover—the man who was destined for her, a man as much a loner as she—is also the
Delm of Korval, arguably the most powerful person on all of Liad. He has the power to remove her and
protect her from the toxic environment of her home Clan. Best of all, he agrees to sit as her co-pilot and her
partner in a courier business.

Even happy endings sometimes show a few flaws. Such as Aelliana's home clan being not as agreeable to
letting her go as it had first seemed. And the fact that someone is stealing pilots in the Low Port, which falls
within the Delm of Korval's honor. Oh, and the revelation that the man she loves—the man who is destined
for her—isn't entirely the man she thought he was. And finally, she discovers that even the lift from Liad
she'd so fervently desired, is part of a larger plan, a plan requiring her to be someone she never thought she
was, or could be.

At the publisher's request, this title is sold without DRM (Digital Rights Management).

Praise for the Liaden Universe® series:

"Every now and then you come across an author, or in this case, a pair, who write exactly what you want to
read, the characters and personalities that make you enjoy meeting them. . . . I rarely rave on and on about
stories, but I am devoted to Lee and Miller novels and stories."
—Anne McCaffrey

"These authors consistently deliver stories with a rich, textured setting, intricate plotting, and vivid,
interesting characters from fully-realized cultures, both human and alien, and each book gets better."
—Elizabeth Moon
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From reader reviews:

Stephen Hilton:

Book will be written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
guide. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important thing to bring us around the world.
Alongside that you can your reading ability was fluently. A e-book Mouse and Dragon (Liaden Universe
Book 7) will make you to become smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about
everything. But some of you think in which open or reading a new book make you bored. It is not make you
fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you looking for best book or suitable book with you?

Barbara Gunter:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the spare time or they will get
great deal of stress from both way of life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have free time, we will
say absolutely without a doubt. People is human not a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity
do you possess when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do
you ever try this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, often the book
you have read is Mouse and Dragon (Liaden Universe Book 7).

Erin Kizer:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book
store? Try and pick one book that you never know the inside because don't assess book by its cover may
doesn't work the following is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not because fantastic
as in the outside appear likes. Maybe you answer can be Mouse and Dragon (Liaden Universe Book 7) why
because the wonderful cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint a person. The
inside or content is definitely fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly
show you to pick up this book.

Isidro Wells:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book had been rare?
Why so many query for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some
people likes reading through, not only science book but additionally novel and Mouse and Dragon (Liaden
Universe Book 7) or even others sources were given understanding for you. After you know how the great a
book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science book was created for teacher or maybe students
especially. Those textbooks are helping them to increase their knowledge. In some other case, beside science
e-book, any other book likes Mouse and Dragon (Liaden Universe Book 7) to make your spare time more
colorful. Many types of book like here.
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