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THE YELLOW HOUSE delves into the passion and politics of Northern Ireland at the beginning of the 20th
Century. Eileen O'Neill's family is torn apart by religious intolerance and secrets from the past. Determined
to reclaim her ancestral home and reunite her family, Eileen begins working at the local mill, saving her
money and holding fast to her dream. As war is declared on a local and global scale, Eileen cannot separate
the politics from the very personal impact the conflict has had on her own life.

She is soon torn between two men, each drawing her to one extreme. One is a charismatic and passionate
political activist determined to win Irish independence from Great Britain at any cost, who appeals to her
warrior's soul. The other is the wealthy and handsome black sheep of the pacifist family who owns the mill
where she works, and whose persistent attention becomes impossible for her to ignore.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Warden:

Book is usually written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can learn everything you want by a guide.
Book has a different type. As we know that book is important issue to bring us around the world. Adjacent to
that you can your reading talent was fluently. A book The Yellow House: A Novel will make you to possibly
be smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can know about every little thing. But some of
you think in which open or reading a new book make you bored. It is not necessarily make you fun. Why
they are often thought like that? Have you seeking best book or appropriate book with you?

Leon Moses:

This book untitled The Yellow House: A Novel to be one of several books this best seller in this year, here is
because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this kind of
book in the book retail store or you can order it via online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It
makes you easier to read this book, as you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason to
you to past this publication from your list.

Douglas Dossett:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always try and and must have the free time or they will get lot of
stress from both everyday life and work. So , when we ask do people have free time, we will say absolutely
yes. People is human not only a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity are you experiencing
when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you try this
one, reading books. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, often the book you have read
is definitely The Yellow House: A Novel.

Paul Cockrell:

This The Yellow House: A Novel is great guide for you because the content which is full of information for
you who also always deal with world and have to make decision every minute. This kind of book reveal it
info accurately using great organize word or we can say no rambling sentences in it. So if you are read the
idea hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward sentences but
tricky core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having The Yellow House: A Novel in your hand
like having the world in your arm, information in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no publication that
offer you world throughout ten or fifteen moment right but this e-book already do that. So , this is certainly
good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt that will?
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