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The definitive story of how Adam Scott broke the biggest hex on Australian sport by winning the 2013
U.S. Masters

Featuring exclusive interviews with Adam Scott, Scott's father Phil, Greg Norman, and every prominent
Australian golfer from British Open champions from Peter Thomson and Ian Baker-Finch to Masters runner-
up Jack Newton, all of whom tried and failed at Augusta, this is the definitive story of how Adam Scott
broke the biggest hex on Australian sport. The most famous tournament of all, the U.S. Masters means
a global TV audience of 150 million, a string of legendary winners—and a curse for Australian golfers. From
Jim Ferrier blowing a huge lead in 1950 to Greg Norman's litany of disasters over decades, the Masters
constantly turned its back on any Australian who looked likely to get close to the holy grail. Then came
Adam Scott. As a boy he'd cried while watching Greg Norman's implosions. He became world junior
champion, and Norman's protege. Come 2013, Scott found himself in the thick of an impossibly dramatic
Masters. Three Australians fought for the lead. Only Scott made it to a sudden-death playoff. Finally Scott
had what Norman never had: one putt to win the Masters.
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From reader reviews:

David Pell:

The book Amen: How Adam Scott Won the US Masters and Broke the Curse of Augusta National can give
more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. Why then must we
leave the good thing like a book Amen: How Adam Scott Won the US Masters and Broke the Curse of
Augusta National? A number of you have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim that book can give
many info for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or facts
that you take for that, you could give for each other; it is possible to share all of these. Book Amen: How
Adam Scott Won the US Masters and Broke the Curse of Augusta National has simple shape however you
know: it has great and large function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by start and read a
publication. So it is very wonderful.

Charles Eiland:

The reserve untitled Amen: How Adam Scott Won the US Masters and Broke the Curse of Augusta National
is the publication that recommended to you to study. You can see the quality of the book content that will be
shown to you. The language that creator use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article
author was did a lot of investigation when write the book, and so the information that they share for you is
absolutely accurate. You also can get the e-book of Amen: How Adam Scott Won the US Masters and Broke
the Curse of Augusta National from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Anthony Sierra:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Make an effort to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't determine book by its cover may
doesn't work is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside
seem likes. Maybe you answer is usually Amen: How Adam Scott Won the US Masters and Broke the Curse
of Augusta National why because the amazing cover that make you consider with regards to the content will
not disappoint an individual. The inside or content is actually fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your
reading 6th sense will directly show you to pick up this book.

Patricia Ramirez:

Publication is one of source of know-how. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but
native or citizen will need book to know the upgrade information of year to be able to year. As we know
those publications have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, could also bring us to around
the world. With the book Amen: How Adam Scott Won the US Masters and Broke the Curse of Augusta
National we can have more advantage. Don't one to be creative people? Being creative person must like to
read a book. Simply choose the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life at
this book Amen: How Adam Scott Won the US Masters and Broke the Curse of Augusta National. You can



more attractive than now.
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