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The Genealogical Magazine of New Jersey or GMNJ is currently published three times each year with an
index of names being published at year's end. It is now in its 88th volume. However, this copy of the second
volume consists of 4 issues reprinted and bound in a single volume, including index of names. A summary of
the articles included in Volume 2 is as follows: Genealogy as a Science; Hunt Households of Sussex County;
Pre-American Notes on Old New Netherlands Families; Gravestone Records from the Caldwell Presbyterian
Church Yard, Essex County; Salem County Marriages Prior to 1800; Gravestone Records from Patrey
Burying Ground, Chester Twp., Morris County; Salem County Marriages 1800-1804; Gravestone Records
from the French-Richards Burying Ground, Springfield Twp., Union County; Halsted Family Bible Records;
Preservation of Records; Our Vital Records Bill Who was Mercy, the First Wife of Benjamin Stelle?; An
Account of Persons Married by Rev. William Worth of Pittsgrove (Daretown) Baptist Church, Salem
County; Gravestone Records from Cemetery at White Oak Ridge, Millburn Twp., Essex County; Gravestone
Records from Board Family Plot, Boardville, Passaic County; Gravestone Records from two De Kay Family
Burying Grounds, Vernon Township, Sussex County; Gravestone Records from Old Methodist Cemetery,
Bloomfield, Essex County; Revolutionary Soldiers of New Providence ; Gravestone Records from Old
Methodist Cemetery, Westfield Township, Union County;
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From reader reviews:

Richard Dunn:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Sure, you
can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a
walk, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open as well as read a book eligible Genealogical
Magazine of New Jersey, Volume 2 (Genealogical Magazine of New Jersey)? Maybe it is to become best
activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's book, you can
cleverer than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have various other opinion?

Loretta Tellis:

This Genealogical Magazine of New Jersey, Volume 2 (Genealogical Magazine of New Jersey) book is just
not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you get by reading this book
is actually information inside this reserve incredible fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper
an individual read a lot of information you will get. This Genealogical Magazine of New Jersey, Volume 2
(Genealogical Magazine of New Jersey) without we recognize teach the one who looking at it become
critical in considering and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry Genealogical Magazine of New Jersey,
Volume 2 (Genealogical Magazine of New Jersey) can bring if you are and not make your bag space or
bookshelves' become full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even cellphone. This
Genealogical Magazine of New Jersey, Volume 2 (Genealogical Magazine of New Jersey) having fine
arrangement in word and also layout, so you will not sense uninterested in reading.

Lucy Broussard:

Do you one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold on guys
this specific aren't like that. This Genealogical Magazine of New Jersey, Volume 2 (Genealogical Magazine
of New Jersey) book is readable by means of you who hate the straight word style. You will find the facts
here are arrange for enjoyable studying experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that want to
deliver to you. The writer regarding Genealogical Magazine of New Jersey, Volume 2 (Genealogical
Magazine of New Jersey) content conveys prospect easily to understand by lots of people. The printed and e-
book are not different in the content material but it just different available as it. So , do you nonetheless
thinking Genealogical Magazine of New Jersey, Volume 2 (Genealogical Magazine of New Jersey) is not
loveable to be your top list reading book?

Jason Young:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the headline Genealogical
Magazine of New Jersey, Volume 2 (Genealogical Magazine of New Jersey) suitable to you? The book was
written by famous writer in this era. Often the book untitled Genealogical Magazine of New Jersey, Volume
2 (Genealogical Magazine of New Jersey)is the main one of several books this everyone read now. This



book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read this guide you will enter the new dimension
that you ever know just before. The author explained their thought in the simple way, consequently all of
people can easily to know the core of this guide. This book will give you a large amount of information
about this world now. In order to see the represented of the world within this book.
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