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The first rule of biography, wrote Justin Kaplan: “Shoot the widow.”

In her new book, Meryle Secrest, acclaimed biographer (“Knowing, sympathetic and entertainingly
droll”—The New York Times), writes about her comic triumphs and misadventures as a biographer in search
of her nine celebrated subjects, about how the hunt for a “life” is like working one’s way through a maze,
full of fall starts, dead ends, and occasional clear passages leading to the next part of the puzzle.

She writes about her first book, a life of Romaine Brooks, and how she was led to Nice and given invaluable
letters by her subject’s heir that were slid across the table, one at a time; how she was led to the villa of
Brooks’ lover, Gabriele d’Annunzio (poet, playwright, and aviator), a fantastic mausoleum left untouched
since the moment of his death seventy years before; to a small English village, where she uncovered a lost
Romaine Brooks painting; and finally, to 20, rue Jacob, Paris, where Romaine’s lover, Natalie Barney, had
fifty years before entertained Cocteau, Gide, Proust, Colette, and others.

Secrest describes how her next book—a life of Berenson—prompted Francis Steegmuller, fellow biographer,
to comment that he wouldn’t touch the subject with a ten-foot pole.

For her life of British art historian Kenneth Clark, Secrest was given permission to write the book by her
subject, who surreptitiously financed it in the hopes of controlling its contents; we see how Clark’s plan was
foiled by a jealous mistress and a stash of love letters that helped Secrest navigate Clark’s obstacle course.

Among the other biographical (mis)adventures, Secrest reveals: how she tracked Salvador Dalí to a hospital
room, found him recovering from serious burns sustained in a mysterious fire, and learned that he was knee-
deep in a scandal involving fake drawings and prints and surrounded by dangerous characters out of Murder,
Inc. . . . and how she went in search of a subject’s grave (Frank Lloyd Wright’s) only to find that his body
had been dug up to satisfy the whim of his last wife.

A fascinating account of a life spent in sometimes arduous, sometimes comical, always exciting pursuit of
the truth about other lives.
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From reader reviews:

Corey Gardner:

The book Shoot the Widow: Adventures of a Biographer in Search of Her Subject can give more knowledge
and also the precise product information about everything you want. Why must we leave the great thing like
a book Shoot the Widow: Adventures of a Biographer in Search of Her Subject? Some of you have a
different opinion about reserve. But one aim in which book can give many details for us. It is absolutely
right. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you are able to
give for each other; you can share all of these. Book Shoot the Widow: Adventures of a Biographer in Search
of Her Subject has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and large function for you. You can search
the enormous world by wide open and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Bobby Gonsalves:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray anyone, why because this Shoot the Widow: Adventures of a
Biographer in Search of Her Subject e-book written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make
book which can be understand by anyone who have read the book. Written within good manner for you,
dripping every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still question Shoot the
Widow: Adventures of a Biographer in Search of Her Subject as good book not just by the cover but also by
content. This is one guide that can break don't determine book by its cover, so do you still needing one more
sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening
to yet another sixth sense.

Refugio Kennedy:

You are able to spend your free time you just read this book this publication. This Shoot the Widow:
Adventures of a Biographer in Search of Her Subject is simple to develop you can read it in the area, in the
beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not have got much space to bring often the printed book, you can
buy the e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. So there
are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Lorraine Michael:

That book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Shoot the Widow: Adventures of a Biographer in
Search of Her Subject was colorful and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Shoot
the Widow: Adventures of a Biographer in Search of Her Subject has many kinds or style. Start from kids
until adolescents. For example Naruto or Private investigator Conan you can read and think you are the
character on there. So , not at all of book are generally make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun
and unwind. Try to choose the best book to suit your needs and try to like reading that.
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