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American literary studies has undergone a series of field redefinitions over the past two decades that have
been consistently described as "turns," whether transnational, hemispheric, postnational, spatial, temporal,
postsecular, aesthetic, or affective. In Turns of Event, Hester Blum and a splendid roster of contributors
explore the conditions that have produced such movements. Offering an overview of the state of the study of
nineteenth-century American literature, Blum contends that the field's propensity to turn, to reinvent itself
constantly without dissolution, is one of its greatest strengths.

The essays in the volume's first half, "Provocations," trace the theoretical and methodological development
and institutional emergence of certain turns, as well as providing calls to arms. The geopolitically oriented
turns toward the transnational, hemispheric, and oceanic (whether Atlantic, Caribbean, Pacific, or
archipelagic in focus) have held a certain prevalence in American studies in recent years, and the second half
of this volume presents a series of scholarly essays that exemplify these subfields.

Taken together, these essays survey the field of American literary studies as it moves beyond new
historicism as its primary methodology and evolves in light of ideological, conceptual, and material
considerations. There is much at stake in these movements: the consequences and opportunities range from
citational and evidentiary practices to canon expansion, resource allocation, and institutional futurity.

Contributors: Monique Allewaert, Ralph Bauer, Hester Blum, Martin Brückner, Michelle Burnham,
Christopher Castiglia, Sean X. Goudie, Meredith L. McGill, Geoffrey Sanborn
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From reader reviews:

Jimmy Dietz:

The experience that you get from Turns of Event: Nineteenth-Century American Literary Studies in Motion
is a more deep you looking the information that hide inside the words the more you get interested in reading
it. It does not mean that this book is hard to recognise but Turns of Event: Nineteenth-Century American
Literary Studies in Motion giving you excitement feeling of reading. The copy writer conveys their point in
selected way that can be understood by simply anyone who read it because the author of this guide is well-
known enough. This book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand
then can go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for having this
kind of Turns of Event: Nineteenth-Century American Literary Studies in Motion instantly.

Patsy Phan:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the concept Turns of
Event: Nineteenth-Century American Literary Studies in Motion suitable to you? The book was written by
well-known writer in this era. The book untitled Turns of Event: Nineteenth-Century American Literary
Studies in Motionis one of several books in which everyone read now. This particular book was inspired
many men and women in the world. When you read this e-book you will enter the new dimensions that you
ever know just before. The author explained their thought in the simple way, therefore all of people can
easily to know the core of this reserve. This book will give you a great deal of information about this world
now. So you can see the represented of the world in this particular book.

Patricia Stroud:

The actual book Turns of Event: Nineteenth-Century American Literary Studies in Motion will bring that
you the new experience of reading a book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. In the event
you try to find new book to read, this book very suitable to you. The book Turns of Event: Nineteenth-
Century American Literary Studies in Motion is much recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-
book from your official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Janice Garcia:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you, why because this Turns of Event: Nineteenth-Century
American Literary Studies in Motion guide written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to
make book that could be understand by anyone who else read the book. Written inside good manner for you,
leaking every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still question Turns of
Event: Nineteenth-Century American Literary Studies in Motion as good book not only by the cover but also
by content. This is one book that can break don't evaluate book by its handle, so do you still needing one
more sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already alerted you so why you
have to listening to a different sixth sense.
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