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Learn how to take great beauty and glamour shots with this practical guide from professional photographer
and teacher,Jon Gray.

Beauty and glamour photographs require the same technical skills as any other area of portraiture  strong
compositions, competent use of lighting, an awareness of how to pose your model to the best effect. The best
shots also demonstrate a creative flair on the part of the photographer that goes way beyond mere titillation.

In this beautifully illustrated guide, Jon Gray explores both the techniques and the aesthetics of his subject 
creating a book that is both informative and a joy to look at.

Covering everything from easy-to-replicate studio poses and lighting set-ups to exotic location work, Beauty
and Glamour Photography is guaranteed to give your photography that all-important creative edge.

Jon Gray has been a professional photographer for 25 years. He specializes in glamour, beauty, fashion and
advertising photography and numbers Vogue, Armani and Gucci among his clients. He teaches fashion and
advertising photography at the American University in London and presents workshops for Bowens lighting,
Mamiya cameras, Lastolite, and Fuji film. He also gives lectures and workshops to professional
organizations, colleges and universities in both the UK and the USA. Jon lives in London.
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From reader reviews:

Cory Kyle:

The book The Complete Guide to Beauty & Glamour Photography give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your
spare time. You can utilize to make your capable much more increase. Book can being your best friend when
you getting pressure or having big problem together with your subject. If you can make examining a book
The Complete Guide to Beauty & Glamour Photography to get your habit, you can get a lot more
advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your knowledge about a number of or all subjects. You
may know everything if you like open and read a guide The Complete Guide to Beauty & Glamour
Photography. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or other folks. So ,
how do you think about this publication?

Lillian Tobias:

The reason why? Because this The Complete Guide to Beauty & Glamour Photography is an unordinary
book that the inside of the reserve waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will zap you with the secret it
inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who have write the book in such awesome way
makes the content within easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning fully. So , it is
good for you because of not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This book will give
you a lot of gains than the other book have got such as help improving your talent and your critical thinking
method. So , still want to delay having that book? If I were being you I will go to the publication store
hurriedly.

Jenny Davis:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book particularly book entitled The
Complete Guide to Beauty & Glamour Photography your head will drift away trough every dimension,
wandering in each aspect that maybe not known for but surely might be your mind friends. Imaging every
single word written in a guide then become one contact form conclusion and explanation this maybe you
never get previous to. The The Complete Guide to Beauty & Glamour Photography giving you one more
experience more than blown away your head but also giving you useful information for your better life on
this era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing pattern here is your body and mind will likely be pleased
when you are finished reading it, like winning a game. Do you want to try this extraordinary spending spare
time activity?

James Edgar:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. That book The Complete Guide to Beauty & Glamour Photography
was vibrant and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book The Complete Guide to Beauty
& Glamour Photography has many kinds or type. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or
Private eye Conan you can read and think that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are
make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and loosen up. Try to choose the best book for yourself



and try to like reading that will.
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